No. PB/1/3/2023-Estt.I] = —
ERUSIECARDE S~
CENTRAL ADMINISTRATIVE TRIBUNAL ST Tetea

U qruia
PRINCIPAL BENCH

WI/Phone: 011- 23385097

/E-mail: cat-delhiGnic.in

61/35, BIRASHT Orf /61735, Copernicus Marg
T &t -110001 / New Delhi — 110001
fea1® /Date: 16.10.2023

To,
The Registrar/Joint Registrar/Deputy Registrar/HoQ
Central Administrative Tribunal '
All Outlying Benches.

Sub: Notifications regarding Registration of Births and Deaths (Amendment) Act, 2023 — reg.

Sir,
I'am directed to forward herewith a copy of Office of the Registrar General, India, M/o
Home Affairs OM No. 1/7/2020-VS(CRS) Part-I dated 22.09.2023 on the subject cited above for

your kind information and further necessary action please.

Yours faithfully,
Encl.: As above, !
KoLy
(P.KK
Deputy Registrar (E)
Copy to:
I~ PA to Principal Registrar, CAT PB, New Delhi. )
2. The FA&CAO, CAT PB, New Delhi. With a request to bring the
3. PA to Registrar, CAT PB, New Delhi. OM to the notice of al
4. Sr. PPS to the Hon’ble Chairman, CAT PB, New Delhi. Officers/officials working
5. PAtolJt Registrar, CAT PB, New Delhi. f under them
6. All Dy. Registrars, CAT PB, New Delhi. ’
7. AD (OL), CAT PB, New Delhi.
8. L&IO, CAT PB, New Delhi. )
9. SO (Comp.), CAT PB, New Delhi with a request to upload it in the website of CAT.,



w.v.4fr./1/3/2023-F41.18
Fearw werds rfaor

Central Administrative Tribunal E1el/Phone-011-23385097
vt =arEds, A5 Fed $#d/Fax-011-23387713
Principal Bench, New Delhi é‘dm'/EmaiIcatdelhi@nic.in

7§ faeai-110001
e :16.10.2023

Jar A,

TEgRAgaFT Woregn/39 FEER/ARTEd 3Teae,
FeATT TATEAF TTEHRIOT,
=T g Faadis,

fawe: Ser vd Heg GNe0T (Fite) yfafras, 2023 & gey 7 HiogEE

Hg1ed,

7 SRFT v, oRR SERE, 9Rd, E ASed § T aod d@ear 1/7/2020-
FrogEnmTE) @s-l, Rerfra 22.09.2023 € vH i HOF GErd T A HE@FE PRAS &
AT H T A FI &

Had,
sl WA

s kit
(dr. 3. i)

39 IR (Fur)

1. e SR, F.9.37, TU ~agde & daiads Hgrde

2. fada FeTEPR Ud HEd @, F.9.37, T F&Wtﬁaaé%?»??rm\ FEATIT AT FI

3, TR, FHEIN, U A4S, 75 Reel & JAFIS TgraT I3 3T SR
4, ATAST NEYL, U3, U SIS, 75 oot altss wua Teh @i || AeRalEaTiEt
5. gFd {TERR, A, T ~aradis, 78 ee & daidds g >‘ F AT A a5
6. Tl 37 IoER, F.U.37, WU =arads, A% el & Y F Ty

7. WERIE fASerh (TSTHIT), H.W.37, W A4S, 75 Goal

8. TEIRT YA AT, 937, v =ade, A5 e —

9,

JregHrer HfEed (FT92Y), FUH, GU SRS, 73 el 58 S AGA i BT
A ITEFE T AU FA F TG & [



- b2 J7

v 5
F. No. 1/7/2020-VS{CRS) Part-1
GOVERNMENT OF INDIA
MINISTRY OF HOME AFFAIRS
QFFICE OF THE REGISTRAR GENERAL, {NDIA
v.5. Division, 2-A Man Singh Road, New Delhi-110011
Email id: drg-crs.rgi@nic.in

Date: 22M September, 2023
Office Memorandum

Subject: Notifications regarding Registration of Births and Deaths (Amendment)

Act, 2023,

The births and deaths registration system provides individuals with the official
recognition and documentation necessary Lo establish legal identity. place and date of
birth or death. The regisiration of births and deaths is mandatory under the
Registration of Births and Deaths (RBD) Act. 1969. The Act is administered by the
Office of the Registrar General. India (ORGI). Ministry of Home Affairs at Centre
and implemented by the State Governments / Union ‘Territories Administrations

throughout the country in accordance with the Rules framed by respective States.

2. The RBD Act, 1969 has been amended and the Registration of Births and
Deaths (Amendment) Act, 2023 (No. 20 of 2023) has been published in the Gazette of
India on 11th August, 25_)2.3 T'he provisions of the aiended Act shall come iato foree
with effect from lst day"‘pf ’Ociobar 2023 (Garette of India. No. 3896 dated 13th

September, 2023) C ,0

15’f the aforeqafd (:azzcttc Nott(:catlom are attached for ready

reference,

ire Mnﬂuenu thc process being followed by Central

w,
‘a, 6"‘-

L
"""""

wm&

£ o




&

at national level [Section 3(5)]; Use of the Birth Certificate as a single document 10
prove the date and place of birth of a person born on or after the date of
commencement of the RBD (Amendment) Act, 2023, for admission to an educational
institution, issuance of a driving licence, preparation of a voter list, registration of a
marriage, appointment to a post in the Central Government ot State Government or a
local body or Public Sector Undertaking or in any statutory or autonomous body
under the Central Government or State Government, issuance of a passport, issuance
of an Aadhaar number or any other purpose as may be determined by the Central

Govemment {Section 17(3)]; etc.

4, In view of the above, it is requested to issue necessary directions to the
concerned officer(s) to look into the provisions of the amended Act and take suitable

action, if any.

FEnclosures: As above ﬁ — M""}

‘ (A.K. Pandey)
Joint Director (CRS)
M obile No. 9811205709

Email 1d: akpandey.rgi@gov.in
To

Secretaries of all Central Ministries / Departments



S0

gt de Eie To—(¥A)04/0007/2003—-23 REGISTERED NO. DL—-(N)04/0007/2003--23

M = A9
The Gazette of Judia

oS- U .- 3.-12082023-248044
CG-DL-E-12082023-248044

STHIER
EXTRAORDINARY
M I —g'E |
PART Il — Section |
e A yeRTiva
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

w 13| + fawel, TEFAR, ST 11, 2023/ S99 20, 1945 (¥F)
No. 23] NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, AUGUST 11, 2023/SRAVANA 20, 1945 (SAKA)

T A § iy g e & et ¥ faed 9w srem deen S s A @ W oEs

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a scparate compilation.

MINISTRY OFLAWAND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)

New Delhi, the 1 th dugusi, 2023/8ravana 20, 1945 (Saka)

The following Act of Parliament received the assent of the President on the
11th August, 2023 and is hereby published for general information:-—

THE REGISTRATION OF BIRTHS AND DEATHS (AMENDMENT)
ACT, 2023

No. 20 or 2023
{Vith Anguse, 2023 ]

An Act further to amend the Registration of Births and Deaths Act, 1969.

Bt it enacted by Parliament in the Seventy-fourth Year of the Republic of India as
follows:—

1. (/) This Act may be called the Registration of Births and Deaths (Amendment)  Short title and
Acl, 2023, crmmencement.

(231t shall come into foree onsuch date as the Central Government may. by notification
in the Official Gazelte, appoint.

1% of 1969, 2. Throughout the Registration of Births and Deaths Act. 1969 (hereinafier referred  Construction

to as thc principal Act). for the word “Registrar-General™, wherever it occurs. the words ‘1‘1 Z“‘:::“-‘

: M P L] - 1 °

“Registrar General of India™ shall be substituted. exprensions hy
certain other
expressiomns,




59

Amendment
of section 2,

Amendment
of section 3.

Amendment
of section 4

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [ParT 11—

3. insection 2 of the srincipal Act, in sub-section (/),—
(/) clause () she 1l be re-numbered as clause {ab) thereof, and before clause (ab)
as $o re-pumbered, the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

‘(a) *Aadraar number” shall have the same meaning as assigned to it in
clause () of section 2 of the Aadhaar (Targeted Delivery of Fir ancia! and Other
Subsudies, Benefits and Services) Act, 2016;

(aa) “adoption™ shall have the same meaning as assigned to it in clause (2)
of section 2 of the Juvenile Justice (Care and Protection of Chilcren) Act, 2015;";
(i) clause () shall be re-numbered as clause (ba) thereof, and before clause (ba)
as 5o re-numbered, the following clause shall be inserted, namely:~-
‘() “database™ means the organised collection of data, generally stored
and accessed in zlectronic form from a computer network;”.
4. In section 3 of the srincipal Act,

(#) in the marginil heading, for the words “Registrar-General, India”, the words
“Registrar General of India” shall be substituted;

(#1) in sub-section (f), for the words “Registrar-General, India™, the words
“Registrar General of India” shall be substituted;

{#ii) in sub-section (3), for the words “and submit”, the words “and the database
of registered births and deaths and submit™ shall be substituted;

(¢v) after sub-section (3), the following sub-sections shall be inszrted, namely:—

“(4) The Registrar General of India shall maintain the database of
registered births and deaths at the National level and it shall be obligatory upon
the Chief Registrars and the Registrars to share the data of registered births and
deaths to such database.

(5) Subject to the proviso to sub-section (/) of section 17 and with the
prior approval of'the Centrat Government, the database of registered births and
deaths maintained under sub-section (4) may, on request, be r ade available to
the authorities dealing with the preparation or maintenance of catabase relating
to—

(a) population register,;

{{) electoral rolls;

(¢} Aadhaar number;

() ratton card;

(e) passport;

(/) driving licence;

{g) property registration; and

(#) sach other databases at the National level as may be notified,

and the authority shall inform the action taken, within such period as may be
notified from time to time, to the Central Government:

Provided that the preparation or maintenance of database relating to
electoral rolls in clause (&) shall be without prejudice to the p ovisions of the
Representation of the People Act, 1950.™.

S. In section 4 of the principal Act, after sub-section (4), the followiag sub-sections

shall be inserted, namely:—

“(3) The Chief Registrar shall take steps to register births or deaths and maintain
a unified database of registered births and deaths at the State level by using the
portal as approved by the Registrar General of India and it shall be cbligatory upon
the Registrars to share the data of registered births and deaths to such database.

I8 of 2016.

2 of 2016.

43 of 1950,



43 of 1950

53 of 2005.

3 of 1897,

2 of 2016.

Sec. 1)

B ¢

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY K

(6) Subject to the proviso to sub-section (/) of section 17 and with the prior

approval of the State Government. the database of registered births and deaths
maintained under sub-section (5) at the State level may, on request, be made available
to the authority dealing with other databases at the State level and the authority shall
inform action taken, within such period as may be notified from time to time, to the
State Government:

Provided that the preparation or maintenance of database relafing to electoral

rolls shall be without prejudice to the provisions of the Representation of the People
Act, 1950

6. ln section 7 of the principal Act,—

({} in sub-section (2),—

(a) after the words “enter in the register maintained”, the words
« electronically or otherwise,” shall be inserted;

(b} after the word and figure “section 97, the words “in respect of births
and deaths which has taken place in his jurisdiction” shail be inserted;

{§{) in sub-section (§),—

(@) for the words “appoint Sub-Registrars and”, the words “appoint
Sub-Registrars and. in the event of any disaster or epidemic, appoint Special
Sub-Registrars” shall be substituted;

{b) the following Explanation shall be inserted. namely:—

‘Explanation.—TFor the purposes of this sub-section, the expressions.

{#) “disaster” shall have the same meaning as assigned to it in
clause () of section 2 of the Disaster Management Act, 2005,

(if) “epidemic” means the epidemic referred to in the Epidemic
Diseases Act, 1897.",

7. In section 8 of the principal Act. in sub-section (/),—

{i) in the opening portion,—

(a) for the words “orally or in writing”, the words “orally or in writing
with signature” shall be substituted;

(b) after the words “several particulars”, the words “including the Aadhaar
number of parents and the informant, if available, in case of birth,” shall be
inserted;

(i} in clause {a), the word “*male” shall be omitted,
(iii) after clause {a), the foliowing clauses shall be inserted, namely:—
“(aa) in respect of non-institutional adoption, the adoptive parents;

(ab) in respect of birth of a child to a single parent or unwed mother from
her womb, the parent;

(ac) in respect of birth of a child through surrogacy, the biological parent;”;
(iv) after clause (d), the following clauses shall bg inserted, namely:—

‘(da) in respect of a child who is taken on adoption from the Specialised
Adoption Agency, the person in-charge of the Specialised Adoption Agency.

Explanation—TFor the purposes of this clause, the expression “Specialised
Adoption Agency” shall have the same meaning as assignedto it in clause {37)
of section 2 of the Juvenile Justice (Care and Protection of Children) Act, 2015;

Amendment
of section 7.

Amecndment
of section 8.




Amendment
of section 10

Amendment
of section 1],

Substitution
of new

section for
section 12,

Certificate of
rggistration
of births or
deaths,

Amendment
of section 3.

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [ParT Hl—

(db) in respect of an orphan or abandoned child or surrendered child in
any child care institution, the person in-charge or caretaker of the child care
institution,

Explanation—For the purposes of this clause, :he eXpressions
“abandoned child” or “child care institution™ or “orphan™ or “surrendered
child” shall heve the same meanings as respectively assigned to them in
clauses (/), (21), (42) and (60) of section 2 of the Juvenile Justice {Care and
Protection of Children) Act, 2015;

{dc} in respect of birth of a child through surrogacy in a surrogacy clinic,
the person in-charge of the surrogacy clinic.

Explanation—For the purposes of this clause, the expressions
“surrogacy™ and “surrogacy clinic” shall have the same meanings as
respectively assigned to them in clauses (zd) and (ze) of sub-section (/) of
section 2 of the Surrogacy (Regulation) Act, 2021;",

8. In section 10 of the principal Act, for sub-sections (2) and (1), the following

sub-sections shall be substituted, namely:—

“(2) Where death occurs in any medical institution proviling specialised
treatment or general treatment, every such institution, irrespective of ownership,
shall, free of charge, provide a certificate of the cause of death, including the history
of illness, if any, signed by the medical practitioner who attended that person during
his recent illness to the Registrar in such form as may be prescribed and provide a
copy of such certificate to the nearest relative.

(3) In the event of death of any person ovcurring in any place other than
medical institution, and such person was, during his recent illness, attended to by a
medical practitioner, such medical practitioner shall, after the deat of that person,
free of charge, forthwith issue, a certificate of the cause of deatn, including the
history of illness, if any, to the person required under this Act to give information
concerning the death in such form as may be prescribed, and the person, on receipt of
the certificate, shall deliver the same to the Registrar at the time of giving information of
the death as required under this Act.”.

9. Insection 1 of the principal Act, for the words “place of abode, and, if he cannot

write”, the words “place of abode and put his signature thereto, and, if he cannot write”
shall be substituted.

10. For section 12 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted,

namely.—

“12. The Registrar shall, as soon as the registration of a birth or death has been
completed, but not later than seven days, give, free of charge, e ectronically or
otherwise under his sigaature, to the person who gives information ur der section 8 or
section 9, a certificate extracted from the register relating to such birth or death in
such form and manner as may be prescribed.”,

{1. In section 13 of tke principal Act, for sub-sections (2} and (3), the following

sub-sections shall be substituted, namely:—

‘(2) Any birth or death of which delayed information is given 10 the Registrar
after thirty days but wihin one year of its occurrence, shall be regisered only with
the written permission of the District Registrar or such other authority. on payment of
such fee and on production of self-attested document in such form and manner as
may be prescribed.

(3) Any birth or ceath of which delayed information is given t3 the Registrar
after one year of its occurrence, shall be registered only on an order made by a

2 of 2016.

47 of 2021



5¢

Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY 5

District Magistrate or Sub-Divisional Magistrate or by an Executive Magistrate
authorised by the District Magistrate, having jurisdiction over the area where the
birth or death has taken place, after verifying the correctness of the birth or death and
on payment of such fee as may be prescribed.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this sub-section, the expression “Executive
Magistrate” means the Executive Magistrate appointed under sub-section (/) of
2 of 1974, section 20 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973.7.

12. lnsection 16 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), after the words “register of
births and deaths”, the words , electronically or otherwise,” shall be inserted.

13. Insection 17 of the principal Act,—

(/) in sub-section (/), for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely:—
*{b) obtain, electronically or otherwise, a certificate of birth or death from
such register and issued in such form and manner as may be prescribed:

Provided that no certificate relating to any death, issued to any person, shall disclose
the particulars regarding the cause of death as entered in the register.”

{if} insub-section (2), for the word “extracts™ occurring at both the places, the
word “certificates™ shall be substituted;

(i) after sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be inserted. namely.—

*(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in any other law for the time
being in force, the certificate referred to in sub-section (2) or section 12, shall be
used to prove the date and place of birth of a person who is born on or after the
date of commencement of the Registration of Births and Deaths (Amendment)
Act, 2023, for the purposes of —

{a) admission to an educational institution;
(b) issuance of a driving licence;

(¢) preparation of a voter list;

{d) registration of a marriage;

{e) appointment to a post in the Central Government or State
Government or a local body or public sector undertaking or in any
statutory or autonomous body under the Central Government or State

. Government;

(/) issuance of a passport;
(g} issuance of an Aadhaar number; and

(#) any other purpose as may be determined by the Central
Government.”.

4. In section 18 of the principal Act, for the words “by the District Registrar”, the
words “in general or special order by the Chief Registrar” shall be substituted.

15. In section 23 of the principal Act,—
(a) in sub-section (/},—

({) in the opening portion, for the words “Any person”, the words, brackets,
figure and letter “Any person, except the person specified in sub-section (/4),”
shall be substituted;

(i} in clause (¢}, after the words “thumb mark™, the words “or signature,
as the case may be.” shall be inserted,;

Amendment
of section 16,

Amendment
of sectipn 17,

Amendment
of section 8.

Amendment
of section 23.




Amenument
of section 24.

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [Part 11—

(#fi) in the long line, for the words “fifty rupees”, the words “two hundred
and fifty rupees™ shall be substituted;

{b) after sub-section /), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—
“({A) Whoever, being a person specified in clauses (0), (c), (), (da), (db),
(dc) and (e) of sub-section (£} of section 8§,—
() fails without reasonable cause to give any information which it
is his duty to give; or

(b) gives or causes to be given, for the purpose of being inserted in
any register of births and deaths, any information whi-h he knows or
believes to be false regarding any of the particulars required to be known
and registered; or

(c) refuses to write his name, description and place of abode or to
put his thurnb mark or signature in the register as required under section 11,

shall be punishzble with fine which may extend to one thousand rupees in
respect of each birth or death.”;
(c) in sub-section (2},—

(¢) after the words “in his jurisdiction”, the words and figures “or to give
a certificate to the informant under section 12" shall be inserted;

(ii) for the words “fifty rupees”, the words “two hundred and fifty rupees”
shall be substituted;

() for sub-secticn (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(3) Any person who neglects or refuses to provide or issue a certificate
as required under sub-section (2) or sub-section (3) of section .0 or any person
neglects or refuses to deliver such certificate to the Registrar, shall be punishable
with fine which inay extend to fifty rupees.”;

() in sub-section (4),-~

(#) for the words “Any Person”, the words, brackets, figure and letter
“Any person except the person specified in sub-section (/4)" shall be
substituted;

(i) for the words “ten rupees”, the words “two hundred ¢ nd fifty rupees”
shall be substituted;

(/) after sub-section {4), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“{4A4) Any person specified in sub-section (/4), who, without reasonable
cause, contraver es any provision of this Act for the contravention of which no
penalty is proviced for in this section, shall be punishable with fine which may
extend to one thousand rupees in respect of each birth or death.™;

(g) in sub-section (5), for the words and figures “Code of Criminal

Procedure, 1898, the words and figures “Code of Criminal Procedure, 973" shall be
substituted.

16. In section 24 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the portion beginning
with the words “proceedings under this Act” and ending with the words “fifty rupees”, the
following shall be substituted, namely:—

“proceedings under this Act,—

(@) accept from the person, except the person specified in sub-section (/A4)
of section 23, who has committed or is reasonably suspected of having
committed an offence under this Act, by way of composition ¢f such offence a
sum of money nat exceeding two hundred and fifty rupees;

5 of 1898,
2 of 1974,



54

Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY 7

(b) accept from the person specified in sub-section (/4) of section 23,
who has committed or is reasonably suspected of having committed an offence
under this Act, by way of composition of such offence a sum of money not
exceeding one thousand rupees in respect of each birth or death.”.

17. After section 23 of the principal Act, the following section shall be inserted, Insertion of new
namely:— section 25A.

“25A. (1) Any person aggrieved by any action or order of,— Appeal.
(i) the Registrar, may prefer an appeal to the District Registrar; or
{if) the District Registrar, may prefer an appeal to the Chief Registrar,

within a period of thirty days from the date of such action of receipt of such order, as
the case may be, in such form and manner as may be prescribed.

(2) The District Registrar or the Chief Registrar, as the case may be, shall decide
the appeal referred to in sub-section (/) within a period of ninety days from the date
of preferring of such appeal.”.

18. [n section 30 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),— Amendment
of section 30.

(1} for clauses (), () and {f), the following clauses shall be substituted, namely:--

“(d) the form of certificate of the cause of death under sub-sections (2}
and (3) of section 10;
{e) the form and manner in which the certificate of birth or death may be
given under section 12;

(/) the authority which may grant permission for registration of a birth or
death and the form and manner of production of self-attested document under
sub-section (2) of section 13;";

(i) after clause (g), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

“(ga) the form and manner in which the certificate of birth or death may be
obtained under clause (#) of sub-section (/) of section 17,

(gb) the form and manner of preferring an appeal under sub-section (/) of
section Z5A:™;

(iif) in clause (i), for the word “extracts”, the word “certificates™ shall be
substituted.

DR. REETA VASISHTA,
Secretary 1o the Govt. of India.

UPLOADED BY THE MANAGER, GOVERNMENT OF INDIA PRESS, MINTO ROAD, NEW DELHI-110002
AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF PUBLICATIONS, DELHI-110054.
Kshitiz St
Mohan wsirw

MGIPMRND—286GH{S3)--11-08-2023.




@t 4, f.uw.- 33004799 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

WS A T - H.-13092023-248699
CG-D1-E-13092023-248699

HYTHEIIW
EXTRAORDINARY
W | I—8F 3—39-" (ii)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (ii)

i & vwfRa
FPUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

€ 3896] 7% Reedt, qerare, BT 13, 2023/91% 22, 1945
No. 3896] NEW DELHI, WEDNESDAY, SEPTEMBER 13, 2023/BHADRRA 22, 1945
g ST

(R F RIS FT FT1AT7749)
% fAeeft, 13 frawa, 2023
HTAT, 4058(H).—Fea1T ATFTT, TH A7 geg Tforedtsor (deitym) afafaw, 2023 (2023 %1 20)
F1 9T | 6T ITYRT (2) FrT wET FRAT HT TG F FU, | dEA, 2023 7 IF IE@ F w9 A A
Fodt &, Sy 3 wfaffaw % gy e 31
[®1.4. 1/7/2020-Fru7 (FHrarvow) gr-1)

MINISTRY OF HOME AFFAIRS
(OFFICE OF THE REGISTRAR GENERAL, INDIA)
New Delhi. the 3th September, 2023

-8.0. 4058(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (2} of section | of the Registration of
Births and Deaths (Amendment) Act, 2023 (20 of 2023), the Central Government hereby appoints the lst day of
Qctober. 2023, as the date on which the provisions of the said Act shall come tnto force.

[F.N3. 1/7/2020-VS (CRS) Part-1]
MRITUNIAY KUMAR NARAY AN, Registrar Gene-al and Census Commissioner

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, Mew Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. wwor  mowo

SUMAR YERMA T e

5859 (172023 (1)



